
PC0000906-0001 

PORTSMOUTH HEALTHCARE NHS TRUST 

GOSPORT WAR MEMORIAL HOSPITAL 

OPEtLATIONAL POLICY - DRYAD WARD (CONTINUING CARE) 

Functional Content 

This facility which will be know~ as Dryad Ward is a 20 bedded area and will 
provide accommodation for men and women over the age of 65 years requMng 
continuing nursing and!or rehabilitation care who are unable to meet the 
criteria to be placed in the Community or Private Sector. 

The service will be provided on a 24 hour, 7 days a week basis for patients 
living witkin the catchment area. 

-[he beds are ananged ix~ 3 x 4 bedded rooms and 8 single bedrooms. 

Shared care for the heavily dependant patients wllo are looked after at home 
and in hospital alternatively on a planned basis w5.11 be offered. 

Facilit es offered include day rooms, activity room, quiet room and essential 
climcal services to. facilitate functioning of the nursing service. 

The Ward will be served by the Hospital Support Services (Laundry, Cleaning, 
Pottering, Catering, Administration). 

The Ward wig fimction within The Trust, The Hospital, Health and Safety and 
Control of Infection Guidelines. 

Philosophy of Service 

Our aim is to provide the ki~aest standard of care possible within the resources 
available. 

Dryad Ward wi!l be regarded as the patients home which will be at the 
forefront when planning patient care. The team will recogaise the prime 
importance of the social aspects of the p~tients lives, that their emotional, 
ph)sical, spiritual and intellectual needs wi!l vary and this will form the basis of 
the Wards philosophy. 

A trained nurse will be nominated to co-ordinate izdividual patient nursing 
care, who will be know~ to patient, relatives and friends. The named nurse will 
ensure patients and/or relatives are involved with formulating care plans 
according to patients wishes. 
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In can-ying out nursing care staffwill recogttise each others skills, experience 

and abilities in meeting the needs of the patient. Nursing practice will be 
developed through research and education/training. 

The service provided will be based on collaboration with all professionals 
havotved with care, hotet and administrative services and from other agencies 
concerned. 

The service will reflect the recognition of the patients rights to a kigh standard 

of care, dignity, respect and kLformation about their well being. 

Pre d icted Workloa ds 

The occupancy of the 20 bedded area is expected to be 90% 

Specific Exclusions 

Patients known to be M.ILS.A. positive or patients who require specific barrier 
nursing. 

Patients under the age of 65 years 

Patients requMng specialised psychiatric care. 

Ooe,rational Systems 

Referrals 

Patients will be referred to the Consultant Geriatrician by GP’s or other 

consultants. On assessment the Consultant Geriatrician will agree priority on 
the waiting fist. 

~e waiting list will be managed centrally at the Geriatric ONce. 

Admissions 

The Ward will advise the Geriatric Office when a bed becomes available, the 
next suitable patient on the waiting list wiI! be admitted to the Ward dttri~g the 
daylight hours. 

Arrangements for admission are made by the Geriatric Office. 

The Medical Records Department will provide the Patients Medical Records. 
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Discharg~ 

A Discharge Plan will be formulated for all patients the Consultant feels 
appropriate to be discharged to alternative accommodation. The procedure for 
patients discharge should be followed (see Appendix 1). 

Should death occur action should be taken as outlined in Body Store Service. 

Reception Pro, ce.du_._r_e 

Patients should arrive at the Hospitals Main Reception on admission where 
they will be directed and if necessary escorted, to the Ward. Here they will .be 
welcomed by the nursing stat~ shown the facilities and given information about 
their care and ward routines. 

qqae Clinical Assistant, Geriatrics, will be advised oft.heir admission. 

A full nursing assessment will be undertaken and Care Plans formulated within 
24 hours of admission. The Care Plans wilt identify the need for clinical input 
from professional and technical staffto ensure that the health needs of the 
patients are met. 

The kitchen will be asked to provide meals to meet the patients nutritional 
needs. 

Arrangements will be made for the patients clothlng to be sent to the patients 
personalised laundry. 

Diversional therapy appropriate to the patients needs/condition will be 

considered and offered. 

All care will be delivered ha accordance with approved nursing procedures and 
Control of Infection Guidelines. 

Staff 

Medical care will be provided by a designated Consultant Geriatrician, Who will 
visit the War~t on a weekly basis. Day to day medical cover will be provided by 
a designated Clinical Assistant working 5 sessions per week. 

Nursing care will be provided 24 hours a day as per nursing rota. There will be 
a trained nurse on duty at all times. 

Clerical support will be provided by a part time Ward Clerk in addition to 
admi~istration back-up from the General Office. 
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All nursin~ ~nd clerical staffwill have job descriptions a~reed 

Pol-tsmouth Heathcare NHS Trust Personnel Department. 

A standard uniform and/or protective clothing will ble issued fbr protection of 
patients and staffand will be worn as directed,     , 

Training for staffwill be co-ordinated by the Ward Sister as agreed with the 

I4ospital Manager, Induction training and basic pro,cedures w~ll be maintained 
and the Ward Sister wilt ensure the training records of all sm’vice staff are 

maintained 

Staffw411 use the central changing facilities on the first floor where male and 

[’emaie cha~agi.ng facilities are provided. 

A di~ing room and coffee iotmge are provided for use of all staff. The Ho~ital 
Smoking Policy will be strictly adhered to by staff at all times. 

System, Proeedure,s. 

Transport - will be provided for patients in accordance to Patient Transport 

Contract. 

Pathology - specimens will be collected from the Ward’ by Portering Staff on a 
scheduled basis and delivered to the Hospitals main collection point. 

X-Rays - patients will. be X-Rayed ~ the Imaging Department oft_he Hospital. 
A nurse will accompany patients if patients require skilled assistance or need to 
be transported in Kings Ftmd Bed. or stretcher. 

Pharmacy - A Pharmaceutical Service wi.ll be provided from Queen Alexandra 

Hospital Pharmacy on a regular basis in !:me with current arra~agements. 

Tb.erapy Services - A Physiothe~:apist, Occupational Therapist and Speech 
Tlierapist will visit the Ward to identify treatment needs on request of the 

Medical Staffand/or Nurse in Charge. 

Arrangements for treatment in the Rehabilitation Department will be the ’ 

responsibility of the Therapist ia collaboration with the Nurse in Cttarge. 
Rehabifitation goals for individual patients will be jointly agreed by the patient 
and multi-diseiplizary team~ Nurses will consult with Therapists in carrying out 
any-rehabilitation elements of the Nursing Care Plans to give continuity and 

co~asisteney of approach. 
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Chiropody Staff - Will visit the Ward as requested by nursing staff according 
to the requirements for individual patients needs. 

Dieticians - Will visit the Ward to advise on individual patients dietary 
requirements, as requested by the Nurse in Charge. 

Dental Staff- Will visit the Ward according to the requhements of individual 
patients needs as requested by the Nurse iz Charge. 

Chaplain Service - Will be available to al! patients, Services wil! be held in the 
Hospital Chapel or on the Ward by arrangements with the visiting Chaplain. 
Appropriate Chaplains will be routinely informed ’of admission in accordance to 
individual patients wishes. 

Pottering - General Porters will maintain a 24 hour cover in the Hospital. They 
will collect and deliver all stores, linen, mail, meal trolleys and other items as 
required and will transport patients by wheelchair, trolley or bed as required. 
They will be responsible for the general security of the Hospital including the 
locking of doors and windows outside of the Ward area, The security of the 
Ward remains the responsibility of the Nurse in Charge. 

Domestic Services - Will be provided in accordance with the agreed 
specification in the current Competitive Tendering Contract (See Domestic 
Service Policy). 

Catering Services - Will be carried out in accordance ~Ath the agreed 
specifications in the current Competitive Tendering Contract (see Catering 
Service Policy). 

Administration - The General Office will provide General Administration, 
Financial and Patient Affairs Services. The office will be open from 8.30am to 
5pro Monday to Friday excluding Bank Holidays. The Support Services 
Manager will be responsible for all activities within the General Office (see 
General Office Policy). 

Medical Records Department - Wig undertake the safe storage and provision of 
Medical Records and maintaittixag statistical information provided by Ward. 
The Mediea! Records Manager will be responsible for all activities witbj.u the 
Medical Records Department (see Medical Records Policy). 

Fire - The Nurse in Charge in conjtmction with the Hospital Manager will be 
responsible for eusuring all staffare aware of correct Fire Procedures to follow 
as advised by the Trusts Fire Officer. 
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Security/Keys 

The Nurse in Charge will be responsible for the security of the Ward i.n regard 

to patients valuables and ward stores/equipment. The Ward security 

arraztgements will t~orm part of the whole Hospital Policy in regards to access 

to the building over the 24 hour period (see Secdrity Policy). 

Refuse - The Nurse ha Charge will be responsible for ensm~g adherence to 
Trust atad Hospital Policies/r~’ocedures for the use of correct colour coded bag 
system and waste disposal for alJ waste produced on the Ward. 

i~ffection Control - The Nurse in Charge in collaboration with the Geriatricians 
will be responsible for reporting any snspect outbreaks of infection to the 
Hospital Manager and for contacting the Control of Infection Team as pet 
Control of infection Guidelines. 

Equipment - Both clinical and non-clinical equipment will be subject to the 
Trusts preference ha regards to economy and maintenance and where applicable 
comply with the standards set by M3ECCLA ,and Control of Ixffection Service. 
The Nurse i~ Charge will be responsible for maintaining records of equipment 
at Ward level and assuming its safe use trader Health and Safety Regulations. 

CSSE/MSE items will be stored in the Clean Utifity Room as per Control of 

I&fection Guidelines. S.I.S. items will be provided by Material Management on 
a top-up basis at agreed levels. All other items will be ordered by Ward staff 
using agreed procedure (see Appendix 3). 

Management - The Ward Sister will have responsibility for the management of 
the Ward including delegated Ward Budgets. Accomatabllity for budget 
control will be in collaboration with the Hospital Manager. The Ward Sister 
will have clinical responsibility to the Trust and will work within the UKCC 

Code of l:h-actice. The Ward Sister will have management responsibility for the 
Nursing Team ha regards to recruitment, deployment of staff, training and 
commtmication. 

The Ward Sister will have reporting duties and will be accountable to the 
Hospital Manager and will need to have working relationships with all 
Departments for the benefit of the patients. 

There will be a sharing of clinical ex’pertise with 6ther Wards and Departments 
and where necessary Staffwill be re-deployed to cover staff deficiencies ha 
other areas. 
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All trained Staff,,,dtt be responsible for ensuring the service offered in the Ward 

will be of a hiN~ quality which can be measured within the Standards set by the 
Trust. Both nursing and medical practices ~,~All be audited. 


